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Tucked away just off the Post Road and I-95 in Greenwich, Conn., sits
Valbella, an upscale Italian eatery popular with Wall Street analysts
and hedge fund managers. In the wine cellar, up to 16 guests can talk
stocks while dining on chicken paillard and sipping their chosen
vintage around a granite table, one with a special heating system. The
Russell 3000 index tracks a very broad set of U.S. companies,
representing most of the stock market capitalization in the United
States. The Russell 1000 index tracks the large and mid-sized
companies of that universe, while the Russell 2000 index tracks the
small cap stocks of that universe. Wilshire tracks the largest universe
of U.S. companies, representing almost the entirety of the market.
Their large cap stock index tracks the top 750 companies. Their small
cap stock index tracks companies that are smaller than the top 750
but larger than the 2,500th largest company. Their micro cap stock
index tracks companies smaller than the 2,500th company. There is
no overlap. Their mid-cap stock index is a bit different because it
tracks the bottom 250 stocks of the large cap index and the top 250
stocks of the small cap index, resulting in a 500-company index of
medium-sized businesses. It is 100% overlapping with other indices.
Interestingly, equal-weight large cap stocks were the second best
performing group, slightly ahead of small cap stocks. The top 750
companies by size, when held in a portfolio in equal amounts,
outperformed small cap stocks when held in order of market cap. A
2017 study by Hendrik Bessembinder that analyzed all U.S. public
stocks over the past 90 years found that small cap stocks have much
higher performance variance. A smaller percentage of small cap
stocks provide positive long-term returns compared to the percentage
of large cap stocks that provide positive long-term returns: As a
consequence, small stocks more frequently deliver returns that fail to
match benchmarks. At the decade horizon, only 42.4% of stocks in the
smallest decile have buy-and-hold returns that are positive and only
36.6% have buy-and-hold returns that exceed those of the one-month
Treasury bill. In contrast, 81.3% of stocks in the largest decile have
positive decade buy-and-hold returns and 70.5% outperform the one-
month Treasury bill. Multiple studies have shown data like this. While



the absolute best small caps outperform the best large caps over a
given period, small caps as a group also have much higher rates of
catastrophic loss. The average returns of large/mid caps and small
caps are similar, but the median returns for small caps are lower.
The only small-cap strategy I like is small cap value, because the
evidence is better there for them actually outperforming long-term.
Small-cap blend and small-cap growth, not so much. Capri Holdings is
a small cap luxury products company that owns the Versace, Jimmy
Choo, and Michael Kors brands. They have a global presence,
including popularity in Mainland China which is an important luxury
market. Small-cap stocks are trading near a two-decade low relative
to large-cap stocks. When the stock market rebounds next year, as is
expected by many investment-bank strategists, those smaller
companies may outperform. Following a stock-market rally from mid-
October through November, stocks have since been sliding. Recession
fears are mounting and the Federal Open Market Committee is
gearing up for another interest-rate increase on Dec. 14. Since the
stock market can be expected to rally amid a recession in anticipation
of a decline in interest rates and a return to economic growth,
investors may well be in for an accelerated rebound for small-caps.
The best way to ride the small-caps, if you expect a market recovery,
might be to buy shares of an exchange traded fund, such as the SPDR
S&P 600 Small Cap ETF SLY, +0.61%, the iShares Core S&P Small
Cap ETF IJR, +0.68% or the Vanguard S&P Small-Cap 600 ETF VIOO,
+0.75%. While investment in the S Fund carries risk, it also offers the
opportunity to experience gains from equity ownership of small-to-
mid-sized U.S. companies. It provides an excellent means of further
diversifying your domestic equity holdings. The S Fund's investment
objective is to match the performance of the Dow Jones U.S.
Completion Total Stock Market Index, a broad market index made up
of stocks of small-to-medium U.S. companies not included in the S&P
500 Index. Therefore, it is not efficient for the Fund to invest in every
stock in the index. The S Fund holds the stocks of most of the
companies in the index with market values greater than $1 billion.
However, a mathematical sampling technique is used to select among



the smaller stocks. Income investors looking for quality dividend
stocks typically buy large-cap stocks. This is understandable, as many
companies with long histories of dividend increases have grown to
dominate their respective industries. But income investors should not
automatically dismiss small-cap dividend stocks, as small-cap stocks
have historically outperformed large-caps. Many small-cap dividend
stocks have strong yields, in addition to their high growth potential.
Investors can combine this outsized growth potential, with dividends
and potential for capital gains through an expanding valuation
multiple. As a result, the top small-cap dividend stocks presented here
could generate superior returns over the next five years. Southside
Bancshares is a bank holding company for the Southside Bank based
in Texas. There are many banks among the list of small cap dividend
stocks, because they tend to have small operations, but pay solid
dividends and their stocks appear undervalued. The First of Long
Island Corporation is the holding company for The First National Bank
of Long Island, a small-sized bank that provides a range of financial
services to consumers and small to medium-sized businesses. Its
offerings include business loans, consumer loans, mortgages, savings
accounts, etc. FLIC operates around 50 branches in two Long Island
counties and several NYC burrows, including Queens, Brooklyn, and
Manhattan. This solid earnings-per-share performance was mostly
driven by higher revenues, although buybacks and margin expansion
also resulted in small tailwinds. During 2021, FLIC generated
earnings-per-share of $1.81, which was a new record result for the
company. It is expected that FLIC will be able to grow its earnings-
per-share further during the current year, and at an attractive pace in
the mid-teens on top of that. This would make 2022 a new record year
for the bank. Stocks offer investors the greatest potential for growth
(capital appreciation) over the long haul. Investors willing to stick
with stocks over long periods of time, say 15 years, generally have
been rewarded with strong, positive returns. The risks of stock
holdings can be offset in part by investing in a number of different
stocks. Investing in other kinds of assets that are not stocks, such as
bonds, is another way to offset some of the risks of owning stocks.



Stock funds are another way to buy stocks. These are a type of
mutual fund that invests primarily in stocks. Depending on its
investment objective and policies, a stock fund may concentrate on a
particular type of stock, such as blue chips, large-cap value stocks, or
mid-cap growth stocks. Stock funds are offered by investment
companies and can be purchased directly from them or through a
broker or adviser. Of course, for a few bucks a day, investors can grab
a subscription to Cabot Small-Cap Confidential, and have all my best
small-cap ideas sent right to them. But you already know that too.
[text_ad] When looking for stocks with very specific characteristics, a
screening tool works best. To be effective, your criteria needs to be
specific enough to weed out the riffraff, but broad enough to pull in
enough results to give you something to work with. For instance, a
simple screen I like looks for stocks within a market cap range, say
$200 million to $600 million, with 20% revenue growth and 20% EPS
growth over the last 12 months, and with a share price over $2.00.
Many of the best small-cap investment ideas come from random
sources. A conversation, a passing glance at something or a magazine
article. A lot of things can set off alarm bells that inspire you to find
stocks to play the trend. Once you have a dozen or so stocks that seem
intriguing, you need to dig deeper. Is it a buy now? Maybe a buy
later? Or a no way in hell am I touching this thing! You need to do a
little technical and fundamental analysis to figure it out. So if you
prefer to skip the digging and research and just want to know the
details on the best small-cap stocks in the market, consider a
subscription to Cabot Small-Cap Confidential today. The average
performance of all open positions is light years ahead of the small-cap
index over the same timeframe. And I have a list of additional
candidates that have a good chance of beating the market in the years
ahead. The Invesco S&P SmallCap Consumer Discretionary ETF
(Fund) is based on the S&P SmallCap 600® Capped Consumer
Discretionary Index (Index). The Fund will normally invest at least
90% of its total assets in the securities that comprise the Index. The
Index is designed to measure the overall performance of common
stocks of US consumer discretionary companies. These companies are



principally engaged in providing consumer goods and services that
are cyclical in nature, including retail, automotive, leisure and
recreation, media and real estate. The Index is a subset of the S&P
SmallCap 600® Index, which is a float-adjusted, market-
capitalization-weighted index reflecting the US small-cap market. The
Fund and the Index are rebalanced and reconstituted quarterly. There
are risks involved with investing in ETFs, including possible loss of
money. Shares are not actively managed and are subject to risks
similar to those of stocks, including those regarding short selling and
margin maintenance requirements. Ordinary brokerage commissions
apply. The Fund's return may not match the return of the Underlying
Index. The Fund is subject to certain other risks. Please see the
current prospectus for more information regarding the risk associated
with an investment in the Fund.
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